A /E-mail: acc.compliance@epfindia.gov.in g /Telephone : 011-26172672
Yaw  /Fax : 011-26103100
ATy sy A e
A/ AAET ARG THR
Employees’ Provident Fund Organisation
(Ministry of Labour, Govt. Of India)

sfasy Y saer, 14-sherehr wT |, 8 e 110066
Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan, 14- Bhikaji Cama Place, New Delhi — 110066

.epfindia. i ia.nic.in
No. Co-ord/3(6)2011/Amendment Sch%q, Date; 28.08.2014
To
All Additional CPFCs (Zones) \ 2 8 AUG 2014

All Regional PF Commissioners
In-Charge of Regional/Sub Regional Offices

Subject 1 Gazette Notification on enhancement of statutory wage ceiling to Rs. 15,000/, minimum
pension of Rs. 1,000/- per month and 20% additional relief on the amount of assurance
benefit admissible under EDLI Scheme, 1976 - regarding.

Sir,
Instructions were issued vide Head Office letter dated 14.07.2014 (placed at SI. No. 268 of the circular
segment of the website), dated 23.07.2014 placed at Si. No. 289 of the circular segment of the website) and dated

01.08.2014 (placed at SI. No 311 of the circutar segment of the website} wherein field offices were directed to start
preparatory activities pending issue of notification on the above subject.

2 Now, the Government of india, Ministry of Labour & Employment issued nofifications enhancing statutory
wage ceiling from existing Rs. 6,500/ to Rs. 15,000/-, fixing minimum pension of Rs. 1000/~ per month and 20%
additional relief on the amount of assurance benefit admissible under EDLI Scheme, 1976 . The copies of the said
noftifications are enclosed herewith.

3. All the Additional CPFCs (Zones) and all Regional PF Commissioners, In-Charge of Regional / Sub-Regional
Offices are requested o ensure implementation of the said notifications in letter and spirit.

Enclosure: As above
Yours faithfully,

i

(P. K. Udgata)
Additional Central P. F. Commissioner-| (Compliance)

Copy fo:
Chief Vigitance Officer
FA & CAO
All Additional CPFCs, Head Quarters.
Director (NATRSS)
All Additional CPFCs Grade-| & Grade-ll, Head Office.
Director (Audit)
Director (Official Language) for Hindi translation.
All Officers, Head Office
All RPFCs In-Charge of Zonal Training Institutes.
. All Deputy Directors (Vigilance), Zones
. All Deputy Directors (Audit)
. RPFC (NDC) for web upload.

. Web Administrator for web upload.
. PS to GPFC for information. 13 &l vy
{P. K. Udgata)
Additional Central P, F. Commissioner-| {Compliance)

WoNOMAWN =

P QP QU G S
LN O




HIId =
Che Gazette of Fndia

EXTRAORDINARY
a1 -0 3—39-Wury (i)
PART I]—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

it & T
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
w42 ¥ Toech, VpaW, 3T 22, 2014 /KW 31, 1936
No. 442 NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, AUGUST 22, 2014/SRAVANA 31, 1936

5 M QIR F=AwT
FegeT

~ 7% T, 22 s, 2014

m.wﬁ.soé(u )—w=rdr wider fAfy aar ydiet svaw «WfRaw, 1952 (1952 w0 19y fi
g 7 # IT-URT (1) F NI ufEw w5 7T wEw aftRdt #T WA w9 BT R /E
Tagr e wiey fAfY aur vl swiw st 1952 # s s gy & F R
et o =t &, gafy:-
1. (1) == Fromr Fr wHErh wireg By (@anm)yae, 2014 s s

(2) =z 01 Rawax, 2014 & wwrdt grfh
2. FHaTd wiasy @iy 9eET, 1952 -

(%) %mUTE 2 F @y (¥) F IT @ (i) ¥ e g AT A wiw /Y 5P o U qAT

" & giyeeiRe T sro,

() %R 26 F IR (6) ® ek @ gTT AT Ui =Y AT it we vy g AR A
sfaegrig e s,

(m) mzstkw&'{r(m%mﬁsm‘ﬂ:Waﬂ‘rmv‘r*s@"‘m%ﬁfaﬁﬁzﬁ
157 “Tg BT T9” §F wiaegiiiy fear ammm

[®1.8. 75-35012/1/2012 waga-11]

3297G12014 n




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PaRT 11—S&C. 3(i))
A ———— e —

————s T————

froqoft: T wfer AR domr, 1952 RArs 2 Rawax, 1952 1 Fwar q1.#LR. 1509 517 Wi &
gy, W [, | 3, 37 |ve (i) ¥ wEwivw 6 € o oy A el # are ¥ Aaiaie

st gy st fm o an-
(1) ar.a1.fr. 584, Raiw 11 7€, 1959
(2) ar.ar.f. 1522, Raiw 16 Ramx, 1960

(3) ar.#.f. 201, Rarw 8 weadl, 1961
(4 a1.#1.1A. 689, Ri® 19 Fagar, 1990
(5) arwr.fr. 326(), s 4 wg, 2001

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014 .
G.S.R. 608 (E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 read with Sui?-section(l) of Section 7 of the

Employees” Provident Funds and Miscellancous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Cental Government hereby
makes the foliowing Scheme, further to amend the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, {952, namely:-

I (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees® Provident Funds (Amendment) Scheme, 2014.
(2) It shall come into force on and from the 1" day of September, 2014.

In the Employees’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1952,-

(a) in paragraph 2, in clause (f), in sub<clause (ii), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”, the
words “ fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

19

(b) in paragraph 26. in sub- paragraph (6), for the words “six thousand and five hundred rupees”. the words
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(¢c) in paragraph 26A, in sub-paragraph (2), in the proviso, for the words “six thousand and five hundred
rupees”, wherever they occur, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

{F. No. $-35012/1/2012-55.11)

ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy.

Note:- The Employees' Provident Funds Scheme, 1952 was published in the Gazette of India, Part 1I, Section 3, Sub-

section (i) dated the 2nd September, 1952 vide notification number S.R.O. 1509 and the relevant paragraphs
were subsequently amended as follows:—

I. G.S.R. 584, dated the i 1th May. 1959.
G.S.R. 1522, dated the |6th December, 1960.
G.5.R. 201, dated the 8th February, 1961.
G.S.R. 689, dated the 19th Octaber, 1990.
G.S.R. 326 (E), dated the 4th May, 2001.

O

afgmT

¥ feelt, 22 arre, 2014
q1.%7.17.609 (). =iy wirer R qur vt waw sffaw, 1952 (1952 #7 19) # a7 7
1 3540 (1) % w9 T qwr 67 grr www AR 1 G F GO 7 wvETe FEAr o A,
» 1995 ¥ 3l Heoftwwr % ¥ g Frwffmr aromy aardt &, anaig-
L (1) =g 9o w de (|l Do, 2014 Fgaman




[wm [[-3vE 3(i)) YRA F TI9T : FEYRY k!

2.

(2) =% 01 RFav, 2014 Fr 79T IFF AT F TWTE Fref
AT Jorr Ao, 1952 F (Taguid 7o AT ¥ ¥ F #=2047) §91-3 H 39877 2 F oigw & w)

oft 37 T AT B gONTE U Y TR ¥ BT YT “Tg g TR ore widwaTite faw o

3.

T Fror1 & QCUTE 6 % WOE (%) ¥ W 42, AN Ud eI opaan wHArd wfdvy Ay A,

1952 ¥ 27-%" & ware “dr Rrawr da7 I R 9 d2g g9 F9¥ F a0@ 39qr 3§ o swwnta
B o

4,

T oAt & & 11 % -

(%) 39-177 (1) 3 37 9o ¥ g Refafae smarfis e sodr, ame.

“(1) FerT g Jaw AR ohvew wrfew S g i Gery 3y F s & Rt § ardw & a7
wer gf & s ¥ Far § sverdt safY F oa v vz ¥ awe afEa B B & afa dee
RTTAS 379 g X ¥ot a9 da o Ruator 01 Rase, 2014 7% Y 78 a7 ang dar & o
FRTANTAS ATy 9T b sroa, S & sfisaw gy gor i giw 8@ oy wfiwg oy m% a e
¥ w3ty & Pro sfdrsaw dug g s iz & spamdrm &

aord % #rf weew Yoy @Y £ gorar wor &0 H B & a3 g of £ w3y ¥ e
T FAF ALY 9T 7T & A4t 39 Aty ¥ e ek e w13 Yo (R § s fem am aw E
9 399 F w27 & aeft wd o, Fr saF Yo F o ¥ R S 9w 399 § w9 7 90
ST,
(@) 7477 (2) o g7 FEY oY 12w aw ol st v @ 3 R A 9 viee sheie B

LILAH
() 3977 (3) F -

() ¥R T ofw ‘gE g T Y TRAE500 YT ¥ ORATT U7 “UEE g9 wIT

() aegE g2 Ry wrom
(7) 39-47 (3) F v, Pafafe sv-d =iy By o, ane -
"(4) 1 Pdaz,2014 ¥ Rl ¥ s adwm wrew o P wa wATR ¥ freer T gg g
i & w97 wfamrg & AfUE Faw F snure 07 gawrT ¥ @ 4, ¥ Prdrew oF sl g agw e
v B A arer A R F s o) gy gone o1 ai¥wrg § A1 A 7 strer v s

719 & I TR N, Ty g Y § 4fYF I A 6 Rafy § w aefam
TTENT et TF Hada a7 et ¥ siwta wevw avg ¥ Pro R gry T s § ¥
Ffafee sivrara & w0 & 1,16 wfaera €1 a7 § svorars = g

7 AT fRFew w7 v 1 AR, 2014 § oz w12 61 omfY & i frrr oo

700 7z ff & drfrr wfier BfY srge gt 9w & R sl @ Amm ar we &
FF 0 §% W afx w7y gy vty FO0r gty T A

39 g ot B 2fX 3% srafy (Rt sfi #fim), § Ré fwer 7980 o0 o @ dr e
wTAT v 3 e ¥ I s o & wfhw storeer  Frwer $1 @ o & v daw G i
39 TEer ) 997 H & A4fF F Ry g o sivem 5 wlard wfier B g 5 sait a-
mwmﬁﬁﬂmﬁam%wﬁwﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁmﬁmmm




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTMORDINARV {PART 11--SEC. 3(i)]

———

—

5. e A ¥ & 12 ¥ 3-8 (2) § PwfRe vogw sirarfia feg e A
“qard ¥ 37 weww F AFAF Fo gagmias s w1 fAEa, 2014 7 v A A9 § Ry
g F i AY w9 wfAmrg ¥ it o 9w o o sl 3wF are & sy F o g g
=% wfdarg ¥ sFaw 397 o7 Ruifa § st

6. A DT F & 14 F forg Refafaa o sfenfRe iy s, s
“14, wEEg o7 wrf Forr ¥ P oy §r ¥ o Far @ ox ey avd wre- =y #r§ weer R
mastf MM R st Fragigaw sifimg@ G, v 25 swdm () F

fafife orx =7 7 1 &, A 37 e ofdw W' F g Rfgg Fandt o 1w w771 w1 gwT o
st a3 30 fAfYy 7t 58 ad it suy ¢ 7 737 ¥ syemefiw Arwrr F HIU-IF 7H 77 71 AFew F
T & - .
Fard B OF wegrgzor =W Y oy F Ry F=r & F w9a IR Faq wAS a4 fiw
wafly §F 7R o ITF Fa7 F Wi siew F g g
TRy A7 A ¥ adw sy, R gfET Gae qrom, 1971 ¥ sty st RefT & s
Fore amferaT % ¥ srgaTe waTEIw Ag-Aar Ay st ¥ w9 § ofwf o ot w0 # B
T g1 Fayfore steramAT #7 sifafres wfes s w0
[F7. 9. TR-35012/1/2012-r40H-[[)
feoqoft:- 7= Ao At Reavs 16 7977, 1995 & sfigaar gwm w1.a.R. 748(3) 7T werfoa iy mar

a1 a1 RawT I & R 14 weadt, 2013 A aftgeem gear avan . 80(x.) grey gonfi fmar w
T

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 609(E).— in exercise of powers conferred by section 6A read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the
Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995, namely;—

1. " (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension (Amendment) Scheme, 2014,
(2) 1t shall come into force on and from the | day of September, 2014.
r

2, tn the Employees® Pension Scheme, 1995, (hereinafier referred to as the principal Scheme). in paragraph 3, in

sub-paragraph 2, in the proviso, for the words “rupees six thousand and five hundred”. wherever they occur, the words
“fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. tn the principal Scheme. in paragraph 6, in clause (a),
Employces’ Provident Funds Scheme, 1932", the words *
thousand rupees”, shail be inserted.

4. . Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph I 1,-

(a) for sub~-paragraph (1) and the proviso thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-
“(1) The pensionable salary shall be the average monthly pay drawn in any manaer including on piece rale basis
during contributory period of service in the span of sixty months preceding the date of exit from the membership
of the Pension Fund and the pensionable salary shall be determined on pro-rata basis for the pensionable service
up to the |” day of September, 2014, subject 10 a maximum of six thousand and five hundred rupees per montn
and (or the period thereafier at the maximum of fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that if a member was not in receipt of fuil pay during the period of sixty months preceding the
day he ceased to be the member of the Pension Fund, the average of previous sixty months fill pay drawn by

him during the period for which contribwion 10 the pension fund was recovered, shall be taken into account as
pensionable salary for calculating pension;

after the words. figures and letter “or 27A of the
and whose pay on such date is less than or equal to fifteen




{wm 11-avg 3(i)] | H T STEE 5

(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for the figures and word “12 months”, wherever they occur, the words “sixty months"
shall be substituted; :
(<) in sub-paragraph (3),- .
(i) for the words, letters and figurcs “rupees six thousand and five hundred/Rs. 6500™, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees™ shali be substituted;
(i) the proviso shal be omitted, ,
(d) after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:-
“(4) The existing members as on the 1* day of September, 2014, who at the option of the employer and
employee, had been contributing on salary exceeding six thousand and five hundred rupees per moath, may on a

[resh option 1o be exercised jointly by the employer and employee continue to contribute on salary exceeding
fifteen thousand rupees per month:

Provided that the aforesaid members have to contribute at the rate of 1,16 per cent on salary exceeding
tifieen thousand rupees as an additional contribution from and out of the contributions payable by the employees
for each month under the provisions of the Act or the rules made thereunder:

Provided further that the fresh option shall be exercised by the member within 4 period of six months
from the 1" day of September, 2014:

Provided also that the period specified in the second proviso may, on sufficient cause being shown by
the member, be extended by the Regional Provident Fund Commissioner for a further period not exceeding six
months:

Provided also that il no option is exercised by the member within such period (including the extended
period), it shall be deemed that the member has not opted for contribution over wage ceiling and the
contributions 10 the Pension Fund made over the wage ceiling in respect of the member shall be diverted to the
Provident Fund account of the member along with interest as declared under the Employees’ Provident Fund
Scheme from time to time.

5. In the principal Scheme in paragraph 12, in sub-paragraph (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that the members’ monthly pension shall be deiermined on a pro-rata basis for the pensionable
service up 10 the 1™ day of September, 2014 at the maximum pensionable salary of six thousand and live

hundred rupees per month and for the period thereafter at the maximum pensionable salary of fificen thousand
rupees per month”.

6. in the principal Scheme, for paragraph 14 the foliowing paragraph shall be substituted, namely.-

14. Benefits on leaving service before being eligible for monthly member's pension.- [f a member has nol
rendered the eligible service specified in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 12 on the date of exit, or on attaining
the 58 years of age, whichever is earlier, such member shall be entitted 1o a withdrawa] benefit as laid down in
Table *D’ or may opt to receive the Scheme certificate provided on the date he has not anained $8 years of age:

Provided that for calculating such withdrawal benefit, the wages at cxit shall be the weighted average
of his wages at the end of every wage ceiling period:

Provided further that an existing member shall receive additional renurn of contributions for his past

service under the Employees’ Family Pension Scheme, 1971, computed as withdrawal-cum-retirement benefits
as per Table ‘A’ multiplied by the factor given in Table ‘B™ ™,

{F.No, $-35012/1/2012-85-It]

ARUN KUMAR SINHA,Addl. Secy.

Note: The principal Scheme was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 11, Suction 3, Sub-section (i), vide
notification number G.S.R. 748 (E), dated the 16th November, 1995 and last amended vide notification number G.S.R.
80(E) dated the {4th February, 2013.

%% Rl 22 s, 2014
a1 #1.03.610(). —Fi=rt wfiwr Bfy aor wff geaw sffaw, 1952 (1952 @ 19)
WP 7 8 IT-UTT (1) F OATA T uv 67 3y e sifRdT &1 ¥A w07 50 e A
T (e wgag A A, 1976 F Sk Avinem 507 § Pre Refafea drn 3 8, b
Lo () 7y Ao w8 A wgag diwr (W) Foem, 2014 wgemr
3297 4’,7;1,’2_




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART [I-—SEC. 3(i)]
=- 1

(2) wg 1 f¥deT, 2014 ¥ ywrdt g
2. wdurt Fdy sgeg o dremn, 1976 # (vagydin ge AT & w9 # geifm) s 7 F, 99
e (1) % “arg oY g @Y S9 ekt F T 9T qug g T oreg winmurfe e s
3. o9 T ¥ e 22 F, - (3) ¥, -

() v (i) ¥, “@g g9 9= A YY" o} ¥ wgra 97 v9Eg g ST sex wiawariea e

'\WQ"?T;

(@) FFT ¥, “ug g T q T MRl ¥ | 97 CIEg g9 w9 w viaefy

ITU
4. we T F Saurs 22 #, Iv-darare (3) ¥ avx, PwfEfae se-trars saenfia B s,
qTHq -

“(4) T FroAT ¥ stata ay ARTw 22 (1), (2) FgaEy (3), FA7 off e @1, § s s
AT F swrar AT it wRers T Ry strom

(¥1.9. 0H-35012/1/2012 "HTH-I ]

frooft: w9l Rér-wag Fiwr Do, 1976 Ris 28 g, 1976 Hway av.a7.f. 488(3) TFT @ F

TSR, FETHTIO, W 0, 909 3, 39 @vy (i) ¥y € 1§ f s o7 avz % Prwgar A9 R
T AT

(hy =FLfR. 1788, RAi% 07.12.1976
2) wranfr 648, frAiw 01.05.1977
(3 =nwLfA 320, RAiw 20.02.1978
(4) @r®.fA. 369, RA 14.07.1978
(5y ar#.fx 67, fReiw 23.12.1978
(6) wLALR. 1013, Fi® 12.09.1980
(" §uwLfR. 548, ReiF03.10.1981
8) w\r#1.fR, 828, fRAi 14.08.1985
9 srafR. 873, At 29.08.1986
(10) wr.#LfR. 228, BATS 02.03.1989
(1}) wre.f3, 354, Rmiw 22.05.1990
(12) =r#f. 30, Rwiw 28.12.1990
(13) =r#LfR. 321, BF1F 16.08.1991
(14)  =rFLR. 420, iF 31.08.1992
(15y =¥ 176, RB=i® 07.03.1994
(16) =r.#1.f%. 334, 7% 20.08.1997
(17)  #.F1./. 238, RA7TF 13.06.2000
(18) Ar.#L. §23(=), 1% 18.06.2010
(19)  #rFfR. g(sn), R+ 08.01.2011
(200 w#.fR. 83(s), RAF 11.02.2011

[



(¥ - 3(i)) NI #1 YIAGR : HWEAT 7

f———SEL_ S — —— .

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 22nd August, 2014

G.S.R. 610 (E). —In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of
the Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following scheme further to amend the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme,1976, namely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be calied the Employees’ Deposit-Linked insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2014.
(2) !t shali come into force on and from the 1* day of September, 2014.

2. In the Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Scheme), in

paragraph 7, in sub-paragraph (1), for the words “six thousand five hundred rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, in sub-paragraph (3),-

(a) in clause (i), for the words “six thousand five hundred rupees”, the words. “fiftecn thousand rupees” shali be
substituted;

(b} in the Explanation, for the words “rupees six thousand five hundred”, the words *‘fifteen thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

4. In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 22, after sub-paragraph (3), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(4) The benefit under this Scheme shall be further increased by twenty percent in addition to the benefits
admissible under sub-paragraph (1), (2) or (3) of paragraph 22, as the case may be.”.

[F. No. $-35012/1/2012-88.11}
ARUN KUMAR SINHA, Addl. Secy.

Note:- The Employees’ Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,

Part 1, Section 3, Sub-section (i); vide number G.S.R. 488 (E) , dated the 28* July, 1976 and subsequently amended as
follows:-

(n GSR 1788, dated 07-12-1976
Q) GSR 648, dated 01-05-1977
(3) GSR 329, dated 20-02-1978
@ GSR 369, dated 14-07-1978
) GSR 67, dated 23-12-1978

6) GSR 1013, dated 12-09-1980
) GSR 548, dated 03-10-1981
(8) GSR 828, dated 14-08-1985
) GSR 873, dated 29-08-1986
(10)  GSR 228, dated 02-03-1989
(i GSR 354, dated 22-05-1990
(12)  GSR 30, dated 28-12-1990
(13)  GSR 321, dated 16-08-1991
(14)  GSR 420, dated 31-08-1992
(5)  GSR 176, dated 07-03-1994
(16)  GSR 334, dated 29-08-1997
(17 GSR 238, dated 13-06-2000
(18)  GSR S23(E), dated 18-06-2010
(190  GSR 9(E), dated 08-01-2011
(20)  GSR 83(E), dated 11-02-2011

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi- 1 10064
and Published by the Controlter of Publications. Dethi-110054.




e e Elo To-33004/99

_REGD. NO. D. L.-33004%9

The Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
qam [1—aU3 3—3Y-WUY (i)
PART l1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
witer | wefim
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 429) =% foelt, WTEETe, 3T 19, 2014/50F97 28, 1936
No. 429 NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, AUGUST 19, 2014/SHRAVANA 28, 1936
o T T W
= famei, 19 R, 2014

w593 (). —Fart wfies fify aen w=iol suay sfufyam, 1952 (1952 1 19) &1 9@ 7 #
FT-9W (1) F WY ufay W0 6% B0 W WA w1 WA ST gQ F% S FEEn GO g9, 1995 § 3
A w9 & foy frafafae g s @, sf -
1. (1) 9% dern SRRt 9ow A (fgdts weiE) @9, 2014 ST o
(2) @ 1 faoam, 2014 B woEl wrft st | '
2 HEER YYE I, 1995 (Tagedd YEd AN & w9 O 53ie) | dowrs 10 8 5% dm (7)
& 3o, Fr=fafea I oo o seanfea fea som, aniy;-

"(79) T8 TOME F vt e fare st vt e wamn®t W Rl T Tea wfea st @ afas
9y fadta ¥ 2014-15 & WaY ¥ ©F T9R ¥R @ ®w 19 gvi 0"

5. qEa Ee B o 18, - 12 & 33 Y (2 8 s) § suff =), wes @
s = fore “ SUIrE 12" VIR Ud o viaweniig feg s o
4 e Iw F T 16 H-
(%) T4 ATmE (2) §, @vE (%) €, 39 @ (iv) B I, Freafafes T avs o wafie fem e,
“ (v )R B T | fr uen, af 9, ofes wivs favs Svm sfoos @ T v @ w0 9, 3R faen
T4 2014-15 ® FaIY T qgrE Wagw 0F 9K #94 H fayr amemt”
(@) I AWM (3) F, @v% (@) & fom, freafefe e shmeaf fem smom, auE -

(@) v T # A wfEe T IR 39 T O (2) # ae %) # wale 8T wfgs Fem A R e b
feaT w1 P |1 o of® & 25 wiova & g o

3232 GI2014

n

f/ﬂ



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [Pakr H—Sec. 3(3)]
" it et e 9 s o o e, R ), e < s et 4 e 2014-15 %
o yfe e 3 & v ved R w9 T e o

(m) IV dww (4) o, @vz (%) 2 fo, Prefifes wve vieafa fem s, sty -

(%) ufk feama wxe Hré TarErd faen 81 o T 8 TRy 9fEm w afeare F o are awet i e v
B I T dg T ), @ 1= 3 Yuww (2) % wvE (%) § Al wites fae S # g o 33 g w75 v
iR TS YA ¥ wEER O

v 7% R v ag @ g owa, ot v, v =pem wifts sem S ffte =l 2014 15 P wew f v
TR E T 9 Q w=Y T e "

(¥ §. #R-15025/3/2007~ TweE-[sm-1]]
Fev1 Han =g, s wiEa

arg fewqor : Fard T g, 1995 B RAE 16 T, 1995 w1 g gem wwL R 748(30) g vl fem

o e froel ww vl w14 werd, 2013 ¥ wfvgeEn dem wmoELfL 80(3) B gr waE e T
o

MINISTRY OF LABOURAND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Deihi, the 19th August, 2014,

GS.R. 593 (E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6A, read with sub-section (1) of sectien 7 of the
Employees’ Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Centrai Government hereby makes
the following Scheme further 1o amend the Employees' Pension Scheme, 1995, namely:-

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees’ Pension (Second Amendment) Scheme, 2014
(2) 1t shall come into force on the st day of September, 2014,
2 In the Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Scheme), in paragraph

12, after sub-paragraph (7), the following sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely;-

“{7A) The monthly member’s pension including any relief payable to any existing or future member under this
paragraph shall not be less than one thousand rupees for the financial year 2014-15",

3. Inthe principal Scheme, in paragraph 15, for the words, brackets and figures “sub-paragraphs (2) to (5) of
paragraph 12, as the case may be,”, the word and figures “ paragraph 12” shall be substituted.

4, In the principal Scheme, in paragraph 16,-

(a) in sub-paragraph (2), in clause (a), after sub-clause (iv), the following sub-clause shall be inserted.
namely:-

“(v} in all the cases, where the monthly widow pension including relief, if any,
per month, the amount of monthly widow
month for the financial year 2014-2015.”;

is less than one thousand rupees
pension in such cases shall be enhanced to one thousand rupees per

(®) in sub-paragraph (3}, for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, nainely:-

*(b) Monthly children pension for each child shall be equal to 25 per cent of the amount admissible to the widow
of the deceased member as monthly widow pension payable under clause (a) of sub-paragraph (2):

Provided that the minimum mounthly children pension including relief, if any, for each child of the deceased
member shall not be less than two hundred and fiy rupees per month for the financial year 2014-2015.":

{c) in sub-paragraph (4), for clause (a), the following clause shali be substituted, namely:-




[ s 11-w8 3(i) ] TRA F1 TATR : TEERY 3

“(a) if the deceased member is not survived by any widow, but is survived by children falling within the definition
of family or if the widow pension is not payable, the children shall be entitled to a monthly orphan pension equal to 75 per
cent of the amount of the monthly widow pension as payable under clause (a) of sub-paragraph (2):

Provided that the minimum monthly orphen peasion including relief, if any, for each orphan shall not be less than
seven hundred and fifty rupees per month for the financial year 2014-15.",

[F. No. R-15025/3/2007.SS-W/PL 11}
ARUN KUMAR SINHA Addl. Secy.

Foot Note.- The Employees’ Pension Scheme, 1995 was published in the Gazette of India vide notification number G.S.R.
748(E), dated the 16th November, 1995 and was lastly amended vide notification number G.S.R. 80(E), dated the

f4th February, 2013.

Printed by the Manager, Government of Indie Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-| 1€064
and Pubtished by the Controtler of Publicativas. Delhi-110054




